Habibur Rahman

From: Md. Shamsul Alam <shamsul@cross-world.com>
Sent: Sunday, January 03, 2021 5:30 PM
To: habib@cross-world.com
Cc: moshiur@cross-world.com; 'Harunor Rashid’
Subject: FW: Meeting Held on 02 January 2021, to resolve the Advance paid for 400 KV
Substation.
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Dear Habib Bhai, P
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Kindly be noted that, as per the meeting with HURDCO on 2" Jan’2021, they agreed to compensate 100,000 Taka i

cancelling the WO of 400 KVA Electrical Substation, confirmed by the helow mail from HURDCO.

HURDCO had given advance amount of Taka 499,000 against the substation and this compensated 100,000 taka will
be deducted from the given advance amount. The rest amount BDT 399,000 from advance amount ta be shifted as
advance payment of 150 KVA Generator that HURDCO has given order to CWPL in separate WO.

We have to send a revised bill to HURDCO for generator deducting the total advance including this shifted 399,000
taka from substation to generator. This is for your information and action please.
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&4 please consider the enviranment before printing this email.

From: Belal Hosan [mailto:belal@cross-world.com]

Sent: Sunday, January 3, 2021 1:03 PM

To: shamsul@cross-world.com

Subject: FW: Meeting Held on 02 January 2021, to resolve the Advance paid for 400 KV Substation.

From: AKM Zaki [mailto:akm.zaki1l955@gmail.com]

Sent: Sunday, 3 January, 2021 12:14 PM

To: shamsul@alarncross-world.com

Cc: belal@cross-world.com; Shah Zakir Hossain; meshah@aquacon.com.hd; hurdcolid@hotmail.corm;
mahabub077@gmail.com

Subject: Meeting Held on 02 January 2021, to resolve the Advance paid for 400 KV Substation.

Dear Mr. Shamsul Alam,
Greetings from HURDCO Ltd. 3

In the light of our yesterday’s meeting to resolve the subject matter (advance payment of TK. 4,99,800 for 400 KV
sub-station ), Cross- world have agreed to adjust Taka 3, 99,800/~ (Three Lac Ninety Nine Thousands Taka only )
with the due payment of 150 KVA Diesel Generator. HURDC Ltd. has agreed to compensate TK. 1,00, 000/- (One
Lac ) paid advance for the 400 KV Electrical Substation.




