
PURCHASE ORDER

GP House
Bashundhara, Baridhara
Dhaka
BD

1229 
Phone No: +88029882990
Fax No: +88029882970

Order No.: 60005915
Release No.: 0
Date: 26-JUL-2021
Agreement No: GP-04986
PR Nos.: 50040026
Department: Tower & Infra 

Operations.Technology

Supplier Name: CROSS WORLD LTD.
Address: HOUSE-NE(O)-06, ROAD-92, 

GULSHAN-2
DHAKA
1000

Telephone:

Fax:

E-mail:

Communication E-mail: ariful@cross-world.com

 
S.No Item Item Description Delivery Date Unit of 

Measure
Qty Unit Price 

(BDT)
Total (BDT)

1 40078175 2 QUANTITY 8000 LTR FUEL 
TANKS WITH NECESSARY 
CONNECTION AND 
ARRANGEMENT WITH 2 QUANTITY
1500KVA GENERATORS & 5 
QUANTITY 800KVA GENERATORS 
AS PER MENTIONED SCOPE-
SAVAR

30-SEP-2021 Each 1 1,953,312.00 1,953,312.00 

2 40078177 2 QUANTITY 6000 LTR FUEL 
TANKS WITH NECESSARY 
CONNECTION AND 
ARRANGEMENT WITH 5 QUANTITY
800KVA GENERATORS AS PER 
MENTIONED SCOPE-GAZIPUR

30-SEP-2021 Each 1 1,359,861.00 1,359,861.00 

3 40078176 2 QUANTITY 8000 LTR FUEL 
TANKS WITH NECESSARY 
CONNECTION AND 
ARRANGEMENT WITH 2 QUANTITY
1500KVA GENERATORS & 1 
QUANTITY 800KVA GENERATORS 
AS PER MENTIONED SCOPE-
JESSORE

30-SEP-2021 Each 1 1,723,424.00 1,723,424.00 

Total Price(BDT) 5,036,597.00

 

Sensitivity: Internal & Restricted
1



Please deliver the above equipment, materials or services as per agreed terms & conditions given below.            
Delivery Terms: As per agreement.   
Delivery Mode: As per Agreement       
Place of Delivery: As per agreement               
VAT/TAX: As per Agreement        
Work Completion Letter: As per Agreement  
Payment Terms: As per agreement          
Termination/Revision: As per Contract  
Packing: As per Agreement   
Invoice: To be Prepared as per GP Instruction             
Certificate: N/A  
Payment Schedule: As per agreement             
Inspection: N/A    
Penalty on Delay: As per agreement                
Warranty: As per agreement

Authorized Signature Authorized Signature

Note: Please sign and return the confirmation copy by fax/ mail.
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Habibur Rahman

From: Md. Ariful Islam <ariful@cross-world.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 01, 2021 12:51 AM
To: 'Habibur Rahman Javed'; shipan@cross-world.com; 'Md. Sakib Ahmed Habib'
Subject: FW: Agreement Signing

Importance: High

Categories: Yellow Category, Green Category, Red Category

FYI….

Best Regards,

Ariful Islam | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager , Sales | | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka 1212,
Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | m: +8801755-514731, 01917-702 131 | e: ariful@cross-
world.com | w: www.cross-world.com

 please consider the environment before printing this emaiL

From:Mohammad Ashiqur Rahaman Tower & Infra Operations Technology
[mailto:ashiqur.rahman@grameenphone.com]
Sent:Wednesday, June 30, 2021 12:45 AM
To:Md. Ariful Islam
Cc: Hirak Kumar Paul Sourcing Finance; Tanvir Islam Bhuiyan Sourcing Finance; Md. Shahidul Islam Tower & Infra
Operations Technology
Subject: RE: Agreement Signing
Importance: High

Dear Arif bhai

Please start Fuel tank arrangement work immediately. We’ll issue PO soon after contract signing. The 1500kVA
generator will be available immediate after Eid and so you need to work fast. For your convenience, please consider
Jessore location as first priority.

Best Regards

Mohammad Ashiqur Rahaman
Deputy General Manager, Power Infrastructure Planning, Technology

Grameenphone Ltd.
+8801711506972
GPHOUSE
Bashundhara, Baridhara, Dhaka-1229
www.grameenphone.com

Facebook |Instagram |Twitter |LinkedIn



2

Sensitivity: Internal

From: Tanvir Islam Bhuiyan Sourcing Finance <t_islam@grameenphone.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 29, 2021 4:17 PM
To:Md. Ariful Islam <ariful@cross-world.com>
Cc: Hirak Kumar Paul Sourcing Finance <hirak@grameenphone.com>; Mohammad Ashiqur Rahaman Tower & Infra
Operations Technology <ashiqur.rahman@grameenphone.com>
Subject: Agreement Signing

Dear Arif Bhai,
Please provide me the signed agreement copy at your earliest.

Regards,
Tanvir Islam

Sensitivity: Internal
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