
1

Shipan Barua

To: Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis
Cc: habib@cross-world.com; paul@cross-world.com
Subject: RE: REGARDING 45 KVA DIESEL GENERATING SET

 
From: NDC Pirojpur [mailto:ndcpirojpur21@gmail.com]  
Sent: Sunday, June 06, 2021 1:13 PM 
To: Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis 
Subject: Re: REGARDING 45 KVA DIESEL GENERATING SET 
 
Thanks Mr.Ezaz for your quotation regarding 45 KVA diesel generator. DC office, Pirojpur would like to purchase a 45 KVA 
generator + foreign canopy+ foreign ATS according to your offered price 11,40,000/- (Eleven lacs fourty thousand) taka 
excluding VAT. We will pay  1,40,000/-as booking money to confirm our goods today. 
 
It will be a great pleasure to buisness with you. 
 
Thanks 
NDC pirojpur 
DC office, Pirojpur 
 
On Thu, 27 May 2021, 8:31 pm NDC Pirojpur, <ndcpirojpur21@gmail.com> wrote: 
Thanks Mr.Ezaz for your quotation regarding 45 KVA diesel generator. DC office, Pirojpur would like to 
purchase a 45 KVA generator + foreign canopy+ foreign ATS according to your offered price 12,00,000/- 
(Twelve lacs) taka. We will pay 10% i.e (1,20,000/-)as booking money to confirm our goods in the next 
working day. 
It will be a great pleasure to buisness with you. 
 
Thanks 
NDC pirojpur 
DC office, Pirojpur 
 
On Wed, 19 May 2021, 5:23 pm Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis, <ezaz@cross-world.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

Refer to the revised Quotation No: CWPL-AM/1174/21 (As per attached offer),  Dated : Mar 14, 2021, we 
have been submitted our final proposal for 45KVA Diesel generating set with Foreign Canopy & Foreign 
ATS. Our final given value was BDT. 12,00,000 and that price included VAT & AIT as per government 
rules. This price also includes the transport ,loading - unloading at site (at ground floor) and excludes the 
price of commissioning materials.  After providing all the materials & mechanical installation we will do 
our commissioning job to star the DG set. 

  

For any further clarifications please feel free to contact with us. 
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Respectfully Yours, 

  

Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis| CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Engineer, Sales Department | Plot 1/B, Road 
90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160  | m: 
+88 01755514748 | w: www.cross-world.com 

  

 

 please consider the environment before printing this email 
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