Shipan Barua

To: Paul; ‘Md. Habibur Rahman '
Cc: ‘Md.Abusieed Sobuj'
Subject: RE: FW: Deed Of Agreement-Cross World Power

From: Paul [mailto:paul@cross-world.com]

Sent: Tuesday, May 25, 2021 2:01 PM

To: 'Md. Habibur Rahman ' (habib@cross-world.com)

Cc: 'shipan@cross-world.com’

Subject: FW: FW: Deed Of Agreement-Cross World Power

Dear Habib Vhai

Please check the attached BOQ and bellow mail confirmation of those attached materials.
They will pay after commissioning the DG .

Please take necessary actions to start that job immediately.

Arunangshu Paul] CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager,Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka 1212,
Bangladesh | p: +880 2 881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 881 5160 | m: 01755514747 | e: paul@cross-world.com
| w: www.cross-world.com

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Sumaya Mostafa [mailto:sumayamostafa@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 25, 2021 12:43 PM

To: Paul

Subject: Re: FW: Deed Of Agreement-Cross World Power

Received and accepted with thanks.

On Tue, 25 May 2021, 12:27 Paul, <paul@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear Sumaya Apu
Please find the attached Revised quotation of materials.

For any further clarifications please feel free to contact with us.

Arunangshu Paul|] CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager,Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka

1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 881 5160 | m: 01755514747 | e: paul@cross-world.com
| w: www.cross-world.com

b% please consider the environment before printing this email
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From: Paul [mailto:paul@cross-world.com]

Sent: Tuesday, May 25, 2021 10:23 AM

To: 'sumayamostafa@gmail.com'

Subject: FW: Deed Of Agreement-Cross World Power

Dear Sumaya Apu

Please find the attached financial offer for commissioning materials of 60KVA DG set. After getting your
confirmation we can star the job of arranging those materials.

For any further clarifications please feel free to contact with us.

Arunangshu Paul|] CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager,Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka

1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 881 5160 | m: 01755514747 | e: paul@cross-world.com
| w: www.cross-world.com

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Paul [mailto:paul@cross-world.com]

Sent: Monday, May 24, 2021 11:47 AM

To: 'sumayamostafa@gmail.com’

Subject: FW: Deed Of Agreement-Cross World Power

Dear Sumaya Apu
Please find the attached BOQ of commissioning materials of 60KVA DG set.

For any further clarifications please feel free to contact with us.

Arunangshu Paul|] CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager,Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka

1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 881 5160 | m: 01755514747 | e: paul@cross-world.com
| w: www.cross-world.com

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Paul [mailto:paul@cross-world.com]
Sent: Thursday, April 1, 2021 2:35 PM

To: 'sumayamostafa@gmail.com’

Subject: Deed Of Agreement-Cross World Power
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Dear Sumaya Apu

Please find the attached Sample Deed of Agreement of 65KV A DG set DG set.

Arunangshu Paul|] CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager,Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka

1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 881 5160 | m: 01755514747 | e: paul@cross-world.com
| w: www.cross-world.com

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Paul [mailto:paul@cross-world.com]

Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 11:16 AM

To: 'sumayamostafa@gmail.com’

Subject: 60KVA DG Quotation-Cross World Power Ltd

Dear Sumaya Apu

Please find herewith the attached Revised quotation of 60KV A (Prime) BIDEFORD brand UK origin diesel
generating set along with a Sample Work Order format.

For any further clarifications please feel free to contact with us.

Arunangshu Paul|] CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager,Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka

1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 881 5160 | m: 01755514747 | e: paul@cross-world.com
| w: www.cross-world.com

b% please consider the environment before printing this email
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