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CROSS WORLD POWER LTD Cross-world

Ensuring Power Since 1983

FINANCIAL OFFER

DATE : Apr 13, 2021
Mr. Audity Ashraf REF : CWPL-AM/0776/21-RO1F
Plot # 557, Road # 19, Block # J, Bashundhara
R/A, Dhaka-1229

FINANCIAL OFFER FOR SUPPLY OF 30 KVA 3 PHASE HEAVY DUTY DIESEL GENERATING SETS.

Dear Sir,
We are pleased to submit our financial offer with reference to our technical offer# CWPL-AM/0776/21-R0O1T dated Apr 13,
2021 :

1. Price:
SL# Product Name Unit Price (BDT) Qty. Total Price(BDT)
1) TEMPEST Brand 30 KVA (Prime) Rating Diesel Generator Set 750,000.00 1.00 750,000.00

with Perkins engine and Stamford alternator

BRAND : Tempest

ENGINE : Perkins, UK

ALTERNATOR : Stamford

CONTROL MODULE : Deepsea, UK

PORT OF SHIPMENT : Felixstowe port, UK

AVAILABILITY : 5 to 15 days from ready stock subject to availability
2) Local Canopy for 30 KVA Genset Pes. 98,000.00 1.00 98,000.00
3) Local Auto Transfer Switch (ATS) for 30 KVA Genset Pcs. 25,000.00 1.00 25,000.00
4) Commissioning Materials, i.e. up to 20 feet Silencer pipe Lot 40,000.00 1.00 1 40,000.00

extension, 1st filling materials & installation accessories
(Except- Cables & Earthing works)

Total Price (Ready Stock) in BDT 913,000.00

Special Discount (43,000.00
GRAND TOTAL (Excluding VAT & AIT)n BDT 870,000.00

Amount in words : BDT Eight Hundred and Seventy Thousand Only.
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FW: Quotation for Substation and Generator (Fixed)

Md. Shamsul Alam

& Ky D
Sat 472472021 9152 AM = - %
To: A.N. M. Nasimunnabi

Md. Shamsul Alam | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Senior Manager, Enterprise Business
Solutions | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 2222
91442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | m: +88 01755514740 | e: shamsul@cross-

world.com | w: www.cross-world.com

& please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Md. Mizanoor Rahman Network Planning & Deployment Technology
[mailto:mizanoor.rahman@grameenphone.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 22, 2021 5:59 PM

To: shamsul@cross-world.com

Cc: Audity Ashraf; me.16life@gmail.com; Mohammed Khaled Mustafa Service Operations

Technology
Subject: Re: Quotation for Substation and Generator (Fixed)

Dear Shamsul Alam vai,

We all are aligned with your final offer. So you can initiate the execution process now. From
our end Jibon (01727380930) will be interface for physical execution and all types of '
payment.

Best Regards

Mizan
01711505061

Get Outlook for Android

From: Audity Ashraf <audity@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 19, 2021 10:20:45 AM

To: Md. Mizanoor Rahman Network Planning & Deployment Technology
<mizanoor.rahman@grameenphone.com>; khaled95@gmail.com <khaled95 @gmail.com>;
asimk143@yahoo.com <asimk143@yahoo.com>; masum504@gmail.com
<masum504@gmail.com>

Subject: Fwd: Quotation for Substation and Generator (Fixed)

Dear All,
Please Find the Final offer from CWL. @ ()>\
&

BR/Audity

. or
—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: Md. Shamsul Alam <shamsul@cross-world.com>
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