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Shipan Barua

From: Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis <ezaz@cross-world.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 4:03 PM
To: 'Md.Abusieed Sobuj'
Cc: paul@cross-world.com; shipan@cross-world.com; habib@cross-world.com; 

nazmul.karim@cross-world.com; 'Naba K Mazumder'
Subject: FW: Offer for Additional Power Cable of 60 kVA Diesel Generating Set

Dear Sobuj Vhai, 
Please take necessary steps for delivery additional (4C-25rm-NYY) power cable as soon as possible. 
 
Client Name: Mr. Md. Siddiqur Rahman 
Offer Ref: CWPL-AM/6747/20-R01 
Site: Plot # 1/D, Road # 01, Block # C, Bashundhara R/A, Dhaka. 
 
 
Respectfully Yours, 
 
Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis| CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Engineer, Sales Department | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 
2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160  | m: +88 01755514748 
| w: www.cross-world.com 
 

 
 please consider the environment before printing this email 
 
From: Md. Siddiqur Rahman [mailto:siddiqurtlb@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, March 04, 2021 3:17 PM 
To: Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis 
Subject: Re: Offer for Additional Power Cable of 60 kVA Diesel Generating Set 
 
 
 
On Thu, 4 Mar, 2021 at 2:45 PM, Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis <ezaz@cross-world.com> wrote: 

Dear sir, 

Refer to verbal confirmation from you. 

Please have a look at a glance the additional expense details. 

  

  

SL JOB DESCRIPTION UOM QTY UNIT TOTAL 
1 Power Cable (4X25rm) Meter 9 1444 12,996 

Special Discount 1,996 
TOTAL BDT. 11,000 
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Respectfully Yours, 

  

Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis| CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Engineer, Sales Department | Plot 1/B, Road 90, 
Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160  | m: +88 
01755514748 | w: www.cross-world.com 

  

 

 please consider the environment before printing this email 

 Dear Mr Ezaz Ibna Aziz, 

Thank you for your above email with quotation for the additional expense details. 
I agree with you. Please take necessary action. I will sure, pay the mentioned due amount as soon as the cable 
will reach at  site.  
Thank you again for your kindnesses to do a special discount for me. 
Regards 
Md Siddiqur Rahman 
 
--  
Md. Siddiqur Rahman  
Managing Director 
Techno Link Bangladesh (Pvt) Ltd. 
Email : siddiqurtlb@gmail.com 
Cell No : +8801711-560478 
Phone : +88029611925, +88029611927 
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