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Shipan Barua

From: h.m Arefin <h.marefin@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2021 12:33 PM
To: Md. Rejul Alam
Cc: 'Shipan Barua'; 'Taz Uddin'; 'Sultan Sakauat Sarkar'; 'Farhana Zaman'; 'Md. Ziaul 

Islam'; 'Md. Bayazid Al Imran'; 'Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed'
Subject: Re: Delivery of Substation

Dear Rejul 
 
engineer will visit 07 march, 2nd part payment (10,22,000)tk will be done 08 march after visit positive report. 
 
 
send revised invoice 
 
thanks 
arefin  
 
On Tuesday, February 23, 2021, 12:18:16 PM GMT+6, Md. Rejul Alam <reajul@cross-world.com> wrote:  
 
 

Dear Sir, 

  

We hereby confirm BDT 20,000 as additional cost. Kindly let us know the date of your engineers visit and payment 
date. 

  

Best Regards 

  

Reajul Alam | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager – National & Strategic Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, 
Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | m: +88 01755514716 | e: reajul@cross-world.com 
| w: www.cross-world.com 

  

 

 please consider the environment before printing this email. 

  

From: h.m Arefin [mailto:h.marefin@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2021 11:42 AM 
To: Md. Rejul Alam 
Cc: 'Shipan Barua'; 'Taz Uddin'; 'Sultan Sakauat Sarkar'; 'Farhana Zaman'; 'Md. Ziaul Islam'; 'Md. Bayazid Al Imran'; 
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'Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed' 
Subject: Re: Delivery of Substation 

  

Dear Mr Rejul 

  

thanks for your gentle support and response. 

  

i agree with below condition. But i request to settle the extra payment (for modification busber and breaker 630 ams to 800 ams as 
per our requirement) on 20000 taka. hope you will not disagree with me. 

  

i can take delivery the substation with in 10th march,by this time you can proceed your self accordingly.my engineer team will 
visit the product three days before delivery.  

  

pls send revised invoice. 

  

thanks again 

  

arefin  

  

On Tuesday, February 23, 2021, 10:51:25 AM GMT+6, Md. Rejul Alam <reajul@cross-world.com> wrote:  

  

  

Dear Sir, 

  

As per our telephonic discussion, please note the blow points. 

  

1.       For up gradation of the breaker and busbar, additional BDT 30,000 is required. However as a gesture of goodwill, 
we would like to make it BDT 24,000. 

2.       Hence the total payment to be made is BDT 1,474,000 (1,450,000 + 24,000) 

3.       Advance payment made as BDT 300,000. 

4.       Payment to be made before delivery BDT 1,026,600 

5.       Payment to be made after commissioning (Final payment) BDT 147,400 

mailto:reajul@cross-world.com
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6.       If you agree with the terms, kindly provide us a confirmation and we will make the panel and transformer ready for 
visit with 7 days. 

  

  

We will wait for your confirmation. 

  

Best Regards 

  

Reajul Alam | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager – National & Strategic Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, 
Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 2222 91442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | m: +88 01755514716 | e: reajul@cross-world.com 
| w: www.cross-world.com 

  

 

 please consider the environment before printing this email. 

  

  

From: h.m Arefin <h.marefin@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Sunday, February 14, 2021 5:13 PM 
To: Md. Bayazid Al Imran <imran@cross-world.com> 
Cc: Moshiur Rahman <moshiur@cross-world.com>; Taz Uddin <taz@cross-world.com>; Remon Das <remon@cross-
world.com>; Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed <habib@cross-world.com>; Shipan Barua <shipan@cross-world.com> 
Subject: Re: Delivery of Substation  

  

Dear Mr Baizid 

  

hope doing well. 

  

it was heavy disaster at covid pandemic situation for all of us.what ever by the grace of almighty still we are remain alive. 

  

we are very much disappointed for our expired honorable chairman MD NAZRUL ISLAM IN LAST JUNE 07,2020. 
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as you know i make an booking for a substation(400 KVA) for our company SHAHCHAND GARMENTS LTD. 

AT THIS MOMENT I WANT TO GET DELIVERY BY NEXT 10 MARCH,2021. 

  

PLS MAKE SURE THE DELIVERY TIME FROM YOUR END. 

  

WAITING FOR REPLY.  

  

BEST WISHES 

  

HUSSAIN MOHAMME AREFIN 

  

  

On Wednesday, September 9, 2020, 10:41:35 AM GMT+6, Md. Bayazid Al Imran <imran@cross-world.com> wrote:  

  

  

  

Dear Sir, 

Good day, 

  

We would like to inform you that within three days we will deliver the Substation after receiving payment. 

  

Best regards, 
  
Mohammad Bayzid Al Imran | CROSS WORLD Power Ltd. | Engineer - Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, 
Bangladesh,, Ctg office: M M Ali Road (lane-1), Baitus Salam Building(Gr. Floor),Dampara| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 
1442 | Cell no: 01755514783 | f: +880 2 5881 6205 | e: imran@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com 

 
a complete Electrical Power solution Company as diesel generator . transfomer . subsatation . busbar trunking system . boiler . lighting . fire 
fighting . point wiring . turnkey solution . etc 
 please consider the environment before printing this email 
This communication contains information which is confidential and may also be privileged. It is for the exclusive use of the intended 
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From: h.m Arefin <h.marefin@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 9, 2020 10:21 AM 
To: Md. Bayazid Al Imran <imran@cross-world.com> 
Cc: Moshiur Rahman <moshiur@cross-world.com>; Taz Uddin <taz@cross-world.com>; Remon Das <remon@cross-
world.com>; Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed <habib@cross-world.com>; Shipan Barua <shipan@cross-world.com> 
Subject: Re: Delivery of Substation  

  

could you pls ensure the delivery schedule after payment.if payment made by today? 

  

On Tuesday, September 8, 2020, 04:27:08 PM GMT+6, Md. Bayazid Al Imran <imran@cross-world.com> wrote:  

  

  

Dear Sir, 

Good day, 

  

I would like to inform you that 400kVA Substation for  Sha Chand Garments is ready to deliver which was slightly modified 
according to your consultants (Mr. Shadat) advice  after receiving PO. We have no objection for any TPI maintaining proper 
authority and procedure. 

  

Best regards, 
  
Mohammad Bayzid Al Imran | CROSS WORLD Power Ltd. | Engineer - Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, 
Bangladesh,, Ctg office: M M Ali Road (lane-1), Baitus Salam Building(Gr. Floor),Dampara| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 
1442 | Cell no: 01755514783 | f: +880 2 5881 6205 | e: imran@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com 

 
a complete Electrical Power solution Company as diesel generator . transfomer . subsatation . busbar trunking system . boiler . lighting . fire 
fighting . point wiring . turnkey solution . etc 
 please consider the environment before printing this email 
This communication contains information which is confidential and may also be privileged. It is for the exclusive use of the intended 
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