
 

 

 

 

 

 
FROM                                                                                        TO                                                                 DATE: 26.01.2020 

COMPANY NAME: EAE ELEKTRIK ASANSÖR END. 
INSAAT SAN VE TIC. A.Ş. 

COMPANY NAME: EUPHORIA APPARELS LIMITED 

ADDRESS: AKÇABURGAZ MAH. 3114 SOK. 
NO: 10 ESENYURT, İSTANBUL, 
TURKEY 

ADDRESS: SHIMULTOLA, JAMGORA, 
ASHULIA, DHAKA, BANGLADESH 

PHONE: 212 866 20 00 PROJECT NAME: EUPHORIA APPARELS LIMITED 

FAX: 212 886 24 20 Bangladesh HS Code: 8537.10.11 

 

SL Description Quantity Unit Price (USD) Total (USD) 

 
1 
 

 
BRAND NEW CAPITAL MACHINERY FOR 100% 
EXPORT ORIENTED READYMADE GARMENTS 
INDUSTRY. ALL THE MATERIALS ARE BUSBAR 
TRUNKING SYSTEMS AND UNDER THE 
CATEGORY OF TAP OFF UNIT, STRAIGHT 
TRUNKING UNIT, JUNCTION UNIT, FEEDER UNIT 
AND DISTRIBUTION BOARD CONNECTION UNIT. 
VOLTAGE NOT EXCEEDING 1000V. 
 
SEA-FREIGHT UPTO CHATTOGRAM. 
 

 
1 SET 

 

 
23,274.00 

 
 

 
23,274.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

2,000.00 
 

TOTAL CFR UP TO CHATTOGRAM PORT 25,274.00 

In Words: USD TWENTY FIVE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED AND SEVENTY FOUR ONLY.  

 

COMMERCIAL CONDITIONS: 

ORIGIN OF GOODS: Turkey 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: Through irrevocable confirmed L/C 100% at sight 
VALIDITY:  30 Days 
DELIVERY TERMS: CFR to Chattogram Port, Bangladesh 
SHIPMENT:  By Sea, within 6-8 Weeks after receipt of completely irrevocable L/C. 
TRANSSHIPMENT: Allowed 
PORT OF LOADING: Any port of Turkey. 
PACKING:  Standard packing and wrapped nylon placed on palettes. 
 
BENEFICIARY NAME AND ADDRESS: 
 
Name : EAE ELEKTRIK ASANSÖR END. INSAAT SAN VE TIC. A.Ş.  
Address : AKÇABURGAZ MAH. 3114 SOK. NO: 10 ESENYURT, İSTANBUL, TURKEY. 
 
BANK DETAILS: 
  
BANK: T.C. ZIRAAT BANKASI  
BRANCH: HADIMKOY/ISTANBUL CORPORATE BRANCH  
BRANCH CODE: 2257  
BANK SWIFT CODE: TCZBTR2A  
IBAN NO (USD): TR120001002257585208715106 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Alper AYYILDIZ 
Export Area Manager 
EAE ELEKTRIK A.S. 

 
 

PROFORMA INVOICE 
OFFER REF NO: CWPL-BBT/0012/21F2 

 

 

 

 



1

Shipan Barua

To: najmul@cross-world.com
Subject: RE: bbt for another floor

 

From: najmul@cross-world.com [mailto:najmul@cross-world.com]  
Sent: Monday, February 8, 2021 11:12 AM 
To: 'Shipan Barua' 
Subject: FW: bbt for another floor 
 
fyi.... 
 

Cordial Regards, 

MD. NAJMUL ISLAM (PRINCE) | CROSS WORLD POWER LIMITED| Engineer-I, Project Division| Plot 1/B, Road 90, 
Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160| m: +8801755 694136 | 
e: najmul@cross-world.com  | w: www.cross-world.com 

 Please consider the environment before printing this email. 

 
From: Euphoria-ELEC-Asst.Mgr-Jubeyer [mailto:elec3@euphoriaapparels.com]  
Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 4:01 PM 
To: najmul@cross-world.com 
Cc: oprn2@euphoriaapparels.com; elec2@euphoriaapparels.com 
Subject: RE: bbt for another floor 
 
Dear Mr. Najmul, 
BOQ is ok. 
Please send PI. 
 
And loan BBT BOQ is ok. 
Please proceed further. 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Hasan Md. Jubayer 
Assistant Manager (Electro-Mecahnical) 
Euphoria Apparels Ltd. (Concern of Bengal Group of Industries) 
Phone: +8801844159016 
E-mail: elec3@euphoriaapparels.com 
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