Cross World Power Limited Crossworld 4

Ensuring Power Sincé 1982

Ref : CWPL-SB/0075/20

To Ak, WO

Date : 03-Sep-2020

N
J&H Holding Limited.
Alamin Icon Centre, 8th Floor 57/4 Progoti Sarani, Gulshan, Dhaka

Site ID JIMMICK, Plot # 324, ROad # 14/B, Block # A, Bashundhara, Dhaka.

QUOTATION FOR ADDITIONAL 04 NOS EARTHING :

Dear Sir

We have since inspected your site and as desired by you we are now pleased to submit below our cost of installatior
& commissioning materials for your above mentioned genset.

SL ProductName . oty ~ Unit Quantity UnitPrice = Total Price
1 Earthing Boring Mtr ~ 120.00 0.00 0.00
2 Gl Pipe 1" Dia Mtr ~ 48.00 0.00 0.00
3  Earthing Busbar Supporter. Pc 2.00 0.00 0.00
4 GEanngplock,.  MERESEN e Bc...1.00 000 0.00
5  Complete Earthing Work lot 1.00 90,000.00 90,000.00
6 2 SWG Copper Lead ' Mtr  124.00 0.00 0.00

: ’ ’ I i & Sub Total : 90,000.00
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Taka /f : \ Grand Total : 90,000.00
:Ninety Thousand Only. T
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N.B  :Prices Excluding VAT & Tax. Cost of additional materials required during the commissioning works of the set

to be borne by you. %

~
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Assuring you of our best services and careful attention at all times, we look forward to receiving your valued work
order. Please retain the original and return the copy of this quotation duly sign by you.

Thanking you. .
Yours faithfully
Cross World Power Limited We hereby accept the above terms & Conditions
A N M Nasimunnabi (Signature with Seal)
Sr. Manager For and on behalf of
01811-412-336 J&H Holding Limited.
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From: A N M Nasimunnabi <nasimunnabi@shaktibd.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 3, 2020 3:16 PM

To: Shipan Barua; Md. Abusieed Sobuj

Cc: Habibur Rahman; Md. Moshiur Rahman

Subject: Fw: Earthing boring

Dear Sobuj Bhai,
Please ignore my previous email.

There is a small correction from customer end; additional earthing will be 4 set, with 2 SWG conductor. Please
take necessaty action.

Thanks,

A N M Nasimunnabi

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: A N M Nasimunnabi <nasimunnabi@shaktibd.com>
To: Mr. Shah-Alam <engrshahalam79@gmail.com>

Ce: Md. Moshiur Rahman <moshiur@cross-world.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 3, 2020, 03:14:39 PM GMT+6
Subject: Re: Earthing boring

Dear Sir,

Thank you for your email. As discussed with you over phone, please note that for additional 4 nos. earthing with
2 SWG conductor total price will be 22,500 x 4 = 90,000 BDT.

»

Please arrange to pay this amount with the next payment without any deduction.

Thanks,

N
A N M Nasimunnabi
Senior Manager | Shakti Engineering Litd. | Cross-World Group
Plot 1/B, Road 90. Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh
WhatsApp: +880 1712 820313 | +880 1811 412336

inledin: nasimunnabi | www.about.me/nasimunnabi

On Thursday, September 3, 2020, 10:32:27 AM GMT+6, Mr. Shah-Alam <engrshahalam79@gmail.com> wrote:

-

" Dear Nasimunnabi Sb,
Pls arrange another 4 nos with 2 SWG copper wire. Payment will be made with next payment.

Best Regards
Shah Alam

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: A N M Nasimunnabi <nasimunnabi@shaktibd.com>
Date: Thu, Sep 3, 2020 at 10:13 AM




e: Earthing boring
. Shah-Alam <engrshahalam79@gmail.com>
: Md. Moshiur Rahman <moshiur@cross-world.com>

Dear Sir,
Thank you very much for your email.

As per our previous offer and your previous work-order Ref: Jimmick/ Substation/ 01, Dated February 26, 2020 unit
rate for each earthing will be 17,000/~ i.c. total charge for additional 3 nos earthing will be 51,000 BDT.

You are requested to arrange this additional payment amounting to 51,000 BDT with the next payment.
Earthing Details: Boring 100 ft, Conductor Size 4 SWG, GI Pipe dia 1 incch, Length 40 ft (20 ft + 20 ft)
This 1s for your kind information and necessary action.

Regards,

A N M Nasimunnabi

wCell: 01811-412336. 01712-820313

On Thursday, September 3, 2020, 08:52:14 AM GMT-+6, Mr. Shah-Alam <engrshahalam79@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mr. Shah-Alam <engrshahalam79@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, Sep 3, 2020 at 8:47 AM

Subject: Earthing boring

To: <moshiur@cross-world.com>

Dear Moshiur Vai,
Please arrange to make the earthing boring another 3 nos out of your contacted 4 nos at our Jimmick project and payment will be
made next accordingly.

e
Best Regards
Shah Alam
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