Md. Ezaz Ibna Anis

From: Avenue Trade Rahman <atel.rahman@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, January 25, 2020 8:13 AM

To: Md. Ezaz Ibne Anis; harunor@cross-world.com

Subject: Re: OFFER OF PRIME 150 KVA / STAND BY 165 KVA DIESEL GENERATING SET
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Dear Sir
Thanks for your price and technical details confirmation as per discussion with Mr. Harun Bhai ,

we are confirming the Order to you by email so that you can proceed and we need the delivery
within 7th of February . please note that we dont want any VAT and TEX as this is for Madrasha
use only , we can pay you cash if you want . Please collect the advance payment on 26th or any

_date from 26th from my office .

Please try to Maintain the delivery within 7th of February as we conformed you on 21st January
through Telephone and as I am in Singapore now , please proceed the order .
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House # 35 (4th Floor), Road # Sonargaon Janapath, Sector # 07,
Uttara, Dhaka -1230. Bangladesh.

Phone: 880-2-8931641, Fax : 880-2-8962756

Mobile : +88-01730435107 , + 88-01713040252
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Chittagong Office : %

House No : 01, Lane No : 01, Block No : L 9
Halishahar Housing State , Chittagong .

Mobile : + 88-01730435103 , +88-01730435107

Email: atel.r)ahman@gmail.com , m.rahman@avenuebd.com

On Thu, Jan 23, 2020 at 2:50 PM Md. Ezaz Ibne Anis <ezaz(@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

-

Please see the attached file for your required PS150 kva diesel generating set with local canopy.



