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Shipan Barua

To: Md. Mizanur Rahman
Subject: RE: [CWP] P.O of DB Panel (for Sample Test)

 

From: Mafizul Islam [mailto:das@cross-world.com]  
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2020 11:06 AM 
To: Ariful Islam 
Subject: FW: [CWP] P.O of DB Panel (for Sample Test) 

 

Fyi….. 

 

Best Regards, 

Mofizul Islam | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Computer Operator, General | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | e: das@cross-
world.com | w: www.cross-world.com 

 please consider the environment before printing this email 

 

 

From: 조병철 [mailto:ironhim.cho@samsung.com]  
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2020 11:01 AM 
To: info@cross-world.com; harunor@cross-world.com; chowdhury@cross-world.com 
Cc: 최호일 
Subject: [CWP] P.O of DB Panel (for Sample Test) 

mailto:das@cross-world.com
http://www.cross-world.com
mailto:ironhim.cho@samsung.com
mailto:info@cross-world.com;
mailto:harunor@cross-world.com;
mailto:chowdhury@cross-world.com
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Dear Mr. Ariful 

  

Pls be informed that Samsung request you to manufacture DB Panel and delivery 

and issue Purchase Order for Sample DB Supply.  

Cross world shall supply DB Panel base on Drawing which was issued by Samsung.  

Samsung will inspect Sample DB and can request rectification if needed 

Samsung will pay these sample DB Panel 4 sets after SAT (Site Acceptance Test) 

Pls be noted that CWP Unit Price includes VAT, AIT as per Quotation.  

*  Delivery unit price is calculated by Amount/ total Qty(269) 

   604.2*4 Sets = TK 2,417  (162,527/269=TK 604.2) 

Pls Infrom us immediately 1. Banking Account (refer to belows)  2. Representative for CWP  

  

 

 
 

   

  Aviation Dhaka Consortium  
      49 Kazi Benzir Sarani, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka 1223 

      Tel. No.                            Fax. No.   
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PURCHASE ORDER  
 
          

 

We are pleased to place an order for the following described commodities on the terms and 
conditions specified hereunder 

        PO Date: 22-Jan-20

 Project: 
HSIA Dhaka 
Airport Project        Budget Code:   

 Supplier:         
Purchase Order 
no.   

  Cross-world Power Ltd     Dhaka/ADC/PO/2020/01/0022 

  
Mr. Ariful Islam 

  M.
 017-5551-

4731 LAS No.:   

  
(info@cross-
world.com)  

 M.  
  

        Seller's Reference: 

          

                   

 Item no. Item Description Unit Q'ty U/Price Amount  
          

              1  DB Panel 400A DB 
Panel  set 1.0           163,108.00                      163,108.00 
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              2  DB Panel 150A DB 
Panel  set 1.0             46,927.00                        46,927.00 

              3  DB Panel 40A DB 
Panel  set 1.0             30,320.00                        30,320.00 

              4  DB Panel Lighting 
DB Panel  set 1.0                 28,961                        28,961.00 

              5  Delivery   JOB 1.0                   2,417                          2,417.00 

  VAT & AIT      Included 

         

          

 Requestor: 
Mr. Byung 
Chul Cho  

 Total TK 271,733.00

                   
          

 Delivery Date : 2020-01-31 
morning      
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 Delivery Location : BSL House, 49 Kazi Benzir Sarani, Nikunja-2, 
Khilkhet, Dhaka 1223  

 Contact Person / Recipient : 
Mr. Al-Amin 
Miah  M)88-017-
7150-0387 

    

   
Mr. Byung Chul 
Cho  M)88-017-0733-
0259 

   

 Payment Terms : Within 30 days 
after delivery      

 Payment Information : a) Name of bank :       

 

  

b) 
Beneficiary 
:  

      

   c) Account 
Number :       

   d) Routing 
Number :       

 Unloading  By Cross-world 
Power Ltd      

 Road Permit N/A       

 Advance Payment Bond:  N/A       

 Penalty :  N/A       

 Retention : N/A       

 Remarks :  Installion & Commission dony by 
Cross-world Power Ltd   

 Inspection Inspection to be conducted by Samsung or authorized 
representative after delivery 
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 Others :  Warranty : 1000 hrs or 1 
year which is earlier    

          
          
          
          

       ACCEPTED BY  

  
 

     
 

          
          
          
               

 Mr. Kyung Ju Kang     Mr. Ariful Islam 

 Project Director       Manager   

 Aviation Dhaka 
Consortium 

    
Cross-world Power Ltd 

  

  

  

--------- Original Message --------- 

Sender : 조병철 <ironhim.cho@samsung.com> 책임/방글라데시 다카공항/삼성물산 

Date : 2020-01-22 20:02 (GMT+9) 

Title : Request bank account for P.O 

  

Dear Mr. Ariful 

  

mailto:ironhim.cho@samsung.com
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Pls inform me belows for PO. 

Payment Information :    
  a) Name of bank : ?? 
  b) Beneficiary : Cross-world   (exact company name) 
  c) Account Number : ?? 
  d) Routing Number : ?? 
  
Thanks 
  

-  조병철(趙炳哲) 책임 - (BC.Cho)  [Brian] 

 

  

-  조병철(趙炳哲) 책임 - (BC.Cho)  [Brian] 
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This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 
www.avg.com  

 

http://www.avg.com

