Rahat Fahim Manwar

From: Minhajul Islam <tusher151280@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 04, 2019 4:22 PM

To: Rahat Fahim Manwar

Cc: abu morshed chowdhury; Subas chandra; MD. MAMUNUR RASHID; Ohiduzzaman

KoMol; kalyanmitra2727 @gmail.com; Sultan Sakauat Sarkar; Md. Ziaul Islam; Mr.
Baijid Hasan Shorif; Techno Consultants; Fakhrul Alam
Subject: Re: Regarding the coordination meeting at JBL Tower

Dear Concern
Reference to as per discussion with you, we confirm that we will pay to you the total cost of RMU room
ventilation fan installation work.

Minhaj
Jamuna Bank

On Tue, Sep 3, 2019 at 6:21 PM Rahat Fahim Manwar <manwar(@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

This is to inform you that today DESCO has visited the site to energize the RMU and advised to install ventilation fan
in the RMU room within next Saturday i.e. 07/09/2019. They will visit again on next Sunday dated: 08/09/2019 and
upon completion of ventilation fan installation, RMU will be energized.

You are requested to take necessary actions regarding this matter urgently.

Thank you.

Rahat Fahim Manwar | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Sr. Engineer , Engineering Dept. |
| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | m:
01755514874 | e: manwar@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com

b% please consider the environment before printing this email.

This communication contains information which is confidential and may also be privileged. It is for the exclusive use of the intended recipient(s).

From: Rahat Fahim Manwar [mailto:manwar@cross-world.com]
Sent: Sunday, September 01, 2019 5:20 PM
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Ensurmg Power Since 1982

, Ref : CWPL-SB/0002/17 Date : 06-Oct-2019

To

Jamuna Bank Limited
Hadi Mansion, 2, Dilkusha C/A,Dhaka

QUOTATION FOR SUPPLY OF EXHAUST FAN AT YOUR SITE : 0

Dear Sir
We have since inspected your site and as desired by you we are now p|eased to submit below our cost of
installation & commissioning materials for your above mentioned genset.

SL ProductName S ~Unit Quantity UnitPrice  Total Price
1 Exhaust Fan 12- lnch Louver , Pc 1.00 7 000 OO 7,000.00
Sub Total : 7,000.00

Taka Grand Total : 7,000.00

:Seven Thousand Only.

N.B :Including VAT & AIT. Cost of additional materials required during the commissioning works etto be

borne by you. _(_\
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Assuring you of our best services and careful attention at all times, we look forward to receiving your valued work
order. Please retain the original and return the copy of this quotation duly sign by you.

Thanking you.
Yours faithfully
Cross World Power Limited y\ We hereby accept the above terms & Conditions
\
el
. SUN . .
Md. Ariful Islam (Signature with Seal)
Manager, Sales & Marketing For and on behalf of
01755514 731 ; Jamuna Bank Limited

H: NE(O) 06, R: 92, Guishan-2, Dhaka-1212 | p: (880 2) 8811858, 8816528 | f. (880 2) 8816205 | e: info@cross-world.com
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