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Habibur Rahman

From: Rashedul Islam <rashed@cross-world.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2019 3:24 PM
To: Harunor Rashid
Cc: Sohel Uddin Bhuiyan; Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed; Monjurul karim; Kazi Lutful

Hoque; Mohammad Sayeful Islam Khan; SK. Shahiduzzaman
Subject: FW: FW: FW: Conversion rate _Parisha Auto Bricks ltd
Attachments: Parisha Auto Bricks Ltd Cheque.jpg

Dear sir,

As you know ,discussed with Kazi sir regarding rest of conversion amount @ parisha auto bricks ltd where is decided
to take BDT 3,00,000.00 from parisha auto Bricks ltd ,now we received BDT 3,50,000.00 from mention client .

This is for your Kind acknowledge .

From: Rashed [mailto:rashed@cross-world.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2019 3:01 PM
To: 'Hashem & Sons'
Cc: 'harunor@cross-world.com'; 'szmonirbd@gmail.com'; 'brictecbd@yahoo.com'; sohel@cross-world.com; Habibur
Rahman Javed <habib@cross-world.com> (habib@cross-world.com); adib@cross-world.com
Subject: FW: FW: FW: Conversion rate _Parisha Auto Bricks ltd

Dear sir,

Greetings from Cross World Power Limited, Please arrange the additional amount as per below mail confirmation
on 31th January, 2019 regarding conversion rate.

At the time providing work order the sales value was GBP 85,000.00+GBP 8,075 = GBP 93,075 and conversion rate
was 1 GBP to 107 BDT.

Now at the time of port clearing conversion rate is 1 GBP to 111.7935 BDT

So you need to pay the additional amount Tk. 4,46,155.01, which calculation is given below;

At the time of providing work order = GBP 93,075 X BDT 107= BDT 99,59,025.00
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At the time of port clearing = GBP 93,075 X BDT 111.7935 = BDT 1,04,05,180.01

Additional value = 1,04,05,180.01-99,59,025.00= 4,46,155.01

Please paid the additional amount Within Ten days after date of delivery the genset at your site .

Please confirm us today as soon as possible because of your two genset will be delivered today night from CTG
Port to your site.

Thanks much

From: Hashem & Sons [mailto:riderjohanfzs@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 31, 2019 12:27 PM
To: Rashedul Islam
Cc: szmonirbd@gmail.com; Sohel Uddin Bhuiyan; Harunor Rashid
Subject: Re: Conversion rate _Parisha Auto Bricks ltd

Yes, I confirm.

On Thu, Jan 31, 2019 at 12:07 PM Rashedul Islam <rashed@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

Please be inform that At the time of work order conversion rate was 1 GBP to BDT 107.As per discussed
with you If Conversion rate will be above BDT 108 at the time of full payment Additional amount will
be paid by you on the other hand if conversion rate will be Lower than BDT 107 at the time of full
payment this amount will be adjusted from rest of payment .

We are waiting for your valuable confirmation.

Please confirm us by mail as soon as possible.
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Thanks much

Md. Rashedul Islam | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Executive, Sales| Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan-2 Dhaka
1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | Mobile: 01755 514 865 | w: www.cross-
world.com

 please consider the environment before printing this email.
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Habibur Rahman

From: Hashem & Sons <riderjohanfzs@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2019 3:02 PM
To: Rashedul Islam
Cc: Harunor Rashid; szmonirbd@gmail.com; brictecbd@yahoo.com; Sohel Uddin

Bhuiyan; Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed; Monjurul karim
Subject: Re: FW: FW: FW: Conversion rate _Parisha Auto Bricks ltd

Yes, I confirm.

On Thu, May 16, 2019 at 3:00 PM Rashedul Islam <rashed@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

Greetings from Cross World Power Limited, Please arrange the additional amount as per below mail confirmation
on 31th January, 2019 regarding conversion rate.

At the time providing work order the sales value was GBP 85,000.00+GBP 8,075 = GBP 93,075 and conversion
rate was 1 GBP to 107 BDT.

Now at the time of port clearing conversion rate is 1 GBP to 111.7935 BDT

So you need to pay the additional amount Tk. 4,46,155.01, which calculation is given below;

At the time of providing work order = GBP 93,075 X BDT 107= BDT 99,59,025.00

At the time of port clearing = GBP 93,075 X BDT 111.7935 = BDT 1,04,05,180.01

Additional value = 1,04,05,180.01-99,59,025.00= 4,46,155.01

Please paid the additional amount Within Ten days after date of delivery the genset at your site .

Please confirm us today as soon as possible because of your two genset will be delivered today night from CTG
Port to your site.

Thanks much
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From: Hashem & Sons [mailto:riderjohanfzs@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 31, 2019 12:27 PM
To: Rashedul Islam
Cc: szmonirbd@gmail.com; Sohel Uddin Bhuiyan; Harunor Rashid
Subject: Re: Conversion rate _Parisha Auto Bricks ltd

Yes, I confirm.

On Thu, Jan 31, 2019 at 12:07 PM Rashedul Islam <rashed@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

Please be inform that At the time of work order conversion rate was 1 GBP to BDT 107.As per
discussed with you If Conversion rate will be above BDT 108 at the time of full payment Additional
amount will be paid by you on the other hand if conversion rate will be Lower than BDT 107 at the
time of full payment this amount will be adjusted from rest of payment .

We are waiting for your valuable confirmation.

Please confirm us by mail as soon as possible.

Thanks much

Md. Rashedul Islam | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Executive, Sales| Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan-2 Dhaka
1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | Mobile: 01755 514 865 | w: www.cross-
world.com

 please consider the environment before printing this email.
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