Rahat Fahim Manwar

From: Md. Ziaul Islam <zia@cross-world.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 30, 2019 9:10 AM

To: Rahat Fahim Manwar

Cc: Sultan Sakauat Sarkar

Subject: FW: Minutes of the meeting held on 25th June 2019 at Techno Consultants for JBL

in presence of representatives of M/s Cross World Power Ltd & M/s Creative
Engineers Ltd

FY!
Best Regards,

Md Ziaul I:.laml CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Head of Pr()duct Pricing, Techmcal &Servu:e |
), Dhaia 1212, Ba ;:-w»a:]:[;e; BBO 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | £ +880 2 5881 5160 |m 80

itaad 00, Guls
01755514777 | 211 @cross-wor ld cont | «: WWW.Cross- world com

Eéﬁ please consider the environment before printing this email.
This communication containg information which is confidential and may also be privileged. 1tis far the exclusiva use of the intended recipient(s).

From: Fakhrul Alam <fakhrul.alam2009@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 26,2019 12:21 PM

To: Harunor Rashid <harunor@cross-world.com>; Md. Ziaul Islam <zia@cross-world.com>; Monirul Islam
<monir@cel.com.bd>; misaha-tech <mlsaha-tech@cel.com.bd>; abu morshed chowdhury
<morshed_shohel@yahoo.com>; Minhajul Islam <tusher151280@gmail.com>; Subas chandra
<subas.chandra@jamunabank.com.bd>; Ohiduzzaman KoMol <komol.eee@gmail.com>; MD. MAMUNUR RASHID
<mamunur.rashid@jamunabank.com.bd>; MD. SAIDUS SALEHIN <saidus.salehin@jamunabank.com.bd>; Techno
Consultants <techno.consultants@yahoo.com>; Quazi Nasiruddin <alim_quazi@yahoo.com>

Subject: Minutes of the meeting held on 25th June 2019 at Techno Consultants for JBL in presence of
representatives of M/s Cross World Power Ltd & M/s Creative Engineers Ltd

Dear all concern,
Reference to above mentioned subject, we would like to inform the following decision regarding MEP
installation of JBL Tower;

1.0 M/s CWPL to be done 1-set of solid copper HDBC wire of earth lead of 2X2/0 SWG in 38mm dia Gl pipe from
ground floor Earth Electrode (near water body) to Lift machine room along BBT duct as per the Iltem schedule no.
17.3 This will be completed within 06th June'2019 for "Special Earthing of Lifts"

2.0 Similarly M/s Cross World Power Ltd will be done 1-set of equi-potential Earth Bar of size
100mmX20mmX600mm complete in all respect at Lift Machine room near to BBT duct wall of 2'-6" above from floor
as per the ltem schedule no. 17.4.3. This will be completed within 06th June'2019

3.0 The installation work of BBT system up to MCC-panel room(Roof-Top) to be completed in co-ordination with
representative of M/s Aziz & Company Ltd within 06th June '2019

4.0 Earth Resistance of Earth Electrodes to be measured in presence of MEP Supervisioh Engineer, JBL Project
Manager, Creative's site Engr's etc. This is requested to CWPL for immediate feedback Magger Result of Earth
Electrodes”. This to be done by TODAY (26th June'2019)

5.0 Representative of CWPL confirmed that "Demand Note for Load Sanction from DESCO will get on 30th
June'2019 & positively to be handed over to JBL.



Cross World Power Limited

Ref : CWPL-AM/0041/17-001

Date : 01-Jul-2019

To

Jamuna Bank Limited
Hadi Mansion, 2, Dilkusha C/A,Dhaka

QUOTATION FOR SUPPLY OF ADDITIONAL INSTALLATION & COMMISSIONING MATERIALS FOR YOUR
800 kVA DIESEL GENERATING SET AT YOUR SITE : PM800

Dear Sir
We have since inspected your site and as desired by you we are now pleased to submit below our cost of
installation & commissioning materials for your above mentioned genset.

SL ProductName ~ Unit Quantity UnitPrice  ° Total Price
1 Earthing Copper Lead Mt 80.00  1,029.00 82,320.00
2 GIPipe Mr 22000 | 000 000
3  GlSocket15'Dia - B Pc 3500 0.00 0.00
4 __FlexiblePipePVC_ ________ Mete 10000 000 000
5  Earthing Copper Bar Sets 1.00  13,807.00 13,807.00
e Sub Total: 96,127.00
Taka Grand Total : 96,127.00

: Ninety-Six Thousand One Hundred Twenty-Seven Only.

N.B :Cost of additional materials required during the commissioning works of the set to be borne by you.

Assuring you of our best services and careful attention at all times, we look forward to receiving your valued work
order. Please retain the original and return the copy of this quotation duly sign by you.

Thanking you.
Yours faithfully

Cross World Power Limited We hereby accept the above terms & Conditions
Md. Ariful Isiam (Signature with Seal)
Manager, Sales & Marketing For and on behalf of
01755 514 731 Jamuna Bank Limited
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