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Paul

From: Md.Hasib Uddin Talukder <robinhasib@gmail.com>
Sent: Sunday, May 12, 2019 12:59 PM

To: Arunangshu Paul

Subject: Re: TEMPEST DG set-Cross World Power Ltd

Dear Arunangshu,

The Quotation for Tempest Brand 80KV A(Diesel Generator) has been approved, Please Sign the Contract
Agreement and issues the Invoice for 70% payment. Also please instruct our site Engineer for Installation

preparation.
Please contact Engr. Anamul 01885698901 .

~On Sun, May 12, 2019 at 9:38 AM Md.Hasib Uddin Talukder <robinhasib@gmail.com> wrote:

On Thu, May 9, 2019 at 1:28 PM Md.Hasib Uddin Talukder <robinhasib@gmail.com> wrote:
Please check

On Wed, May 8, 2019 at 12:03 PM Arunangshu Paul <paul@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear Robin

Please find herewith the attached quotations of 80KVA, 135KVA & 150KVA TEMPEST brand UK
origin diesel generating set with Locally fabricated Canopy & ATS.

»

For any further clarifications please feel free to contact with us.

Arunangshu Paul| CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager,Sales | Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka
1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 881 5160 | m: 01755514747 | e: paul@cross-world.com
| w: www.cross-world.com

5% please consider the environment before printing this email

Best regards

/Md.Hasib Uddin Talukder (Robin)







