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Habibur Rahman

From: sohagsat97@gmail.com
Sent: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 12:20 PM
To: Md. Yezzum Hossain Sujan
Cc: Ariful Islam; Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed; Harunor Rashid; Multi Trade Enterprise

Limited; Showmitro
Subject: Re: PSI for satkhira Medical College

Dear Yezzum,

Thanks for your mail. I am confirming about the PSI of generator in UK. Two engineers of HED will
visit the UK as well as participate the eyewitness test. We will confirm the amount of money which
is required for the eyewitness test. Is this money paid in bangladeshi Taka or GBP of UK ? Please
let us know.

Therefore, we are looking forward about this matter.

On Monday, February 11, 2019, 10:28:51 AM GMT+6, Md. Yezzum Hossain Sujan <yezzum@cross-world.com>
wrote:

Dear Sir

Yet we didn’t any reply from your end.

Please notice chain mail and give us feedback as early as possible.

Thanks & Best regards,

Md Yezzum Hosain | CROSS WORLD GROUP | Engineer , Project Division| Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka
1212, Bangladesh | phone: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | fax: +880 2 5881 5160 | cell: +880 17555 14778 | email:
yezzum@cross-world.com web: www.cross-world.com

 please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Yezzum Hosain [mailto:yezzum@cross-world.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 7, 2019 10:23 AM
To: 'Abdul Hamid'
Cc: 'Ariful Islam'; 'Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed'; 'Harunor Rashid'
Subject: PSI for satkhira Medical College

Dear Sir
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As discussed yet we didn’t get any PSI confirmation from your end, requesting you to provide us below
information.

1. Will you only visit our Manufacturing Factory or will done Witness test.

2. If you only visit our factory Charge will be GBP 1500.00 and for witness Test charge will be GBP
2,000.00 (However you have to deposit this money before confirming the manufacturing order)

3. How many person will go for PSI.

4. After getting your all confirmation we will place the order to our principal and will let you know what will
be the PSI time.

Note:

1. Cross world will provide only Offer Letter from AML.

2. MTEL will be responsible for VISA processing, Plain fair, Transportation (UK internal), Accommodation
and other related cost of PSI.

Your kind co-operation and early reply is highly appreciated.

Thanks & Best regards,

Md Yezzum Hosain | CROSS WORLD GROUP | Engineer , Project Division| Plot 1/B, Road 90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka
1212, Bangladesh | phone: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | fax: +880 2 5881 5160 | cell: +880 17555 14778 | email:
yezzum@cross-world.com web: www.cross-world.com

 please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Abdul Hamid [mailto:sohagsat@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 17, 2019 12:13 PM
To: yezzum@cross-world.com
Subject: Name of the work for satkhira Medical College

Dear yezzum,

Please see the top of technical specification document.
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Thanks

with best regards

Sk. Abdul Hamid

DGM Electrical
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Multitrade Enterprise Ltd. (MTEL)

Email: sohagsat@gmail.com
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