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PRINTING PRESS

Date: 15 October, 2018
To

Managing Director
Cross-World Power Ltd
Plot-1/B, Road-90, Gulshan-2 Dhaka-1212, Bangladesh.

Attn: Engr. Najmul Islam

Sub: Work Order for Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of Bus Bar Trunking
System for Premier Printing Press (Omicon Group), Matuail , Dhaka.,

Kindly refer to the subject mentioned above, we would like to inform you that management has
agreed to procure the following quantity and terms & conditions:

Foreign Part for Bus Bar Trunking (BBT) System:

A3t : Unit Price Total Price
l SL Description [ Unit | Qty (USD) (USD)
600A TPN+PE, 4W, AL IP55 POWER BBT
01 ’ FOR PHASE-5&6 (Brand: E AE, Turkey)jm 1 | USD13500.00 l USD13500.00

0 1250A TPN+PE, 4W, AL IP55 POWER
[ BBT FOR PHASE-7(Brand: EAE, Turkey)

Total Amount in USD [ USD53900.00

*** BBT connection will be up to Machine .{TOR 15 Mle by ('Aloleg)-
Local Part for Bus Bar Trunking (BBT) System: -

1 I USD40400.00 ' USD40400.00

E Description L Unit | Qty Ul(l]i;;ll:;ce To(t;;).-l;;ige
I | BBT Installation Materials | No | 1 [1,50,00000 | 1,5.00000
2 | BBT Installation Charge A | No | 1 [ 1,00,00000 1,00,000.00
Total Amount in BDT =2,50,000.00 - ;
Payment Mode : ‘s
yForeign Payment: Total Amount in USD 53,900.00 ; L “"‘PW“LL ?hy Lof P INDH
100% payment at sight through an irrevocable letter of credit(L/C). Ay Loy
Local Payment : Totai Amount for in BDT 2,50,000.00 ¥ pre apmeck § mpedir-
® 50% in advance with work order PAE AnY fendt

® 40% after Materials delivery at site
* 10% after Testing, Commissioning and handing over the system to the purchaser or
their representative.
Delivery Time : Delivery & installation, testing & commissioning have to be completed by within 60
days for Foreign part and 50 days for Local part from the date of L/C Opening.

Warranty : 1 (One) year from the date of commissioning.
You are requested to take necessary steps in ensuring timely supply and installation.

Thanking You

Mohafhimad Hasanur Rahman Md(Rezaul Karim

Gengral Manager (Production ) CEO

Lect blications Ltd BelivIT Md. Rezaul .Kaﬂm
CEO, beliviT

Razzak Tower (5th Floor), 5 Purana Paltan, Dhaka-1000, Bangladesh
Phone: 7125851, 9560714, Fax: 7125854, E-mail: premierprintingpress@gmail.com

Corporate
Headquarter




naimul@cross-world.com

From: Md Rezaul Karim [rezaul.karim@omicon.com]

Sent: Sunday, October 28, 2018 1:48 PM

To: 'Md. Najmul Islam’

Cc: ‘Alamgir S'

Subject: RE: Additional requirements due to change of Utility room (USD771 3.00)
%—

Dear Mr Najmul

AdLtional ¢ne walve $7713.00 .

Thank you, J\L@

Md Rezaul Karim

IT Consultant

OMICON GROUP | WWW.omicongroup.com

T (880) 2 712 5851 ext 490, C (880) 192 2101112

N OMICON

4 ' Iease consides the weviranment belgre Drinting this v-mails
w1t -
§ S m;«m.mqmmxamnp mwmmmmchm

Disciaimer: This message is for the named addressees' use only. It may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information. if you are not the
intended recipient, please immediately delete it to avoid any LEGAL issues . Unless otherwise stated, any commercial information given in this message should
be treated as preliminary only and subject to our formal written confirmation as per OMICON GRDUP's communication policy.

From: Md. Najmul Islam [mailto:najmul@cross-world.com]

Sent: Sunday, October 28,2018 1:45 PM

To: rezaul.karim@omicon.com

Cc: 'Alamgirst

Subject: FW: Additional requirements due to change of Utility room (USD7713.00)

BYl....

Cordial Regards,

MD. NAIMUL ISLAM (PRINCE) | CROSS WORLD POWER LIMITED | Engineer-|, Project Devision| Plot 1/B, Road 90,
Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160| m: +8801755 694136 |
e: mjmul@cross-world.com | w: WWw.cross-world.com

4 Please consider the environment before printihg this email,



From: ngjmul@grgss-wgrlg.gom [mailtg:najmul@gross-world.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 25,2018 11:32 AM

To: 'hasanur'

Dear sir,
As per site visit with Mr., Alamgir Sir, below items need as additional requirements due to change of Utility room,

l UNIT PRICE
,3(‘5 DESCRIPTION Qry. UNIT

Usp
1 KXA 12504-B-sTD 1250 A-BOLT-ON-STANDARD LENGHT- 14 !
4w (Phase-7)

TOTAL PRICE

M Shat 1718 S 2,405.20

2 KOA 0654-“-STD-600 A-PLUG-IN-STANDARD LENGTH-4W 41 M $ 127.0
(Phase-S&G)
3 KO-6Al/8Cy HORIZONTAL FIXING UNIT (Phase~5&6) 29 ’ PC S

= 50, We need USD7713.00 (After Discount) for additional work purpose,
Ifis it ok, then we will sent p}.

If you have any further information or clarification, please feel free to contact with ys.
We look forward to hearing response from you,

Cordial Regards,

ENGR. MD. NAIJMUL isLam (PRINCE) | CROSS WORLD POWER LIMITED | Engineer-I, Project Devision | Plot
1/B, Road 90, Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 58815160
m: +8801755 694136 | e: najmul Cross-world.com | w: WWW.cross-world.com

s Please consider the environment before printing this email, .



