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From: najmul@cross-world.com

Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2018 10:00 AM

To: ‘arif.unifill@gmail.com'

Cc: ‘Nurul Islam Bhuiyan Manik-UDPFML'; 'Kamal Uddin Ahmed'
Subject: FW: Regarding BBT reinstallation issues for Unifill Textile.
Dear sir,
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Rrmablicg ming g,

MD. NAJMUL ISLAM {PRINCE) | CROSS WORLD POWER LIMITED | Engineer-l, Project Devision| Plot 1/B, Road 90,
Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160] m: +8801755 694136 |
e: najmul@cross-world.com | w: Www.cross-world.com

Please provide us approval & payment.

Cordial Regards,

o Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Md. Fahim Muntasir [mailto:fahim@cross—world.com]
Sent: Monday, November 12, 2018 5:23 PM

To: Md. Najmul Islam

Ce: Sultan Sakauat Sarkar; ziaul islam .
Subject: Regarding BBT reinstallation issues for Unifill Textile.

Dear Najmul Vi,
As discussed, We shall do this 630A & 1250A BRT Re-installation wark for Unifill Textile, Re-installation charge will
need to 56,000.00 BDT.

S Worker per Amount per Working Remarks

S/L Description iy ey day/Night Total (Tk.) :

01. | 630A BBT 08 500 7 2800000 | 'Mstalled BBT remove &
Re-installation

02. | 1250A BBT 08 500 7 28,000.00 IRSUTRABET rEmevs &
Re-installation

Total Amount (Tk.) ( 56,000.00
S —

Please take necessary action regarding re-installation issues.

Best Regards,

Md. Fahim Muntasir| Cross World Power Ltd. | Asst. Engineer, Engineering Department | piq

desh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 Cell no: 0175569411 9] f: +880 2 5881 J16(

A

Guishan - 2, Dhaka 1212, Bang

M: fahim@cross-world.com | w: Www.cross-warld.com

5% please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Fahim Muntasir [mailto:fahim@cross-world.com]
Sent: Monday, September 03, 2018 1:41 PM




