BIG BOSS CORPORATION LTD

% APTECH INDVSTRIAL PARK
30 SARABO, KASHIMPUR, GAZIPUR

Ref. Date:22:10,2015 .
Ref: AlP/Big Boss/2018

Chairman

Cross-world power Ltd.

House 1/B,Road 90,Gulshan-2
Dhaka-1212

Attention: Mr.Sabbir Ahmed,AGM Project Sales Cross-world.

Subject: Work Order for 33KV new line Construction Aditional Part.
Dear Sir, _
With reference to your quotation no CPL/AIP/170918, dated 17.09.2018 attached herewith and subsequent discussion

with you, we are pleased to issue the work order for Construction of 33KV new overhead line with materials and pole
muffling & additional line construction & approved by Gaznpur PBS under the following price, terms & condition:

Description of work Quantity Unite Price Total price (Tk.)

33KV line construction with r}ia'terials, carrying with to the site,
BREB & Consulting Supervision fee (Including all right of way/ A a
hazards) &t Big Boss Corporation Ld{Apioch Indusicinl Parky | 01 100 Tk. 11,00,000/ Tk. 11,00,000/
30.Sarabo.Kashimpur.Gazipur.

Terms & Condition:

01) All the technical terms & condition will be as per your final offer submitted on 17.08.2018 @nd approved by the
management of Big Boss Corporation Ltd.

02) Work Completion time : Within 30(Thirty) days from the date of Signing the work order

03) Big Boss Corporation Ltd. Is not liable for any loss or damage of human or properties due to construction
works till hand over of the total work.

04) Mode of Payment : Payment will be made as per following instaliment basis :

1= : 50% Payment will be made alo ﬁz‘ the work prder.
2n : 50% (a) Payment will be made% gr!é;ﬁgf z n Site. s
(b} After completion of line constructlon
(c) After commissioning and handing over the sub-station.
(d) After giving completion report duly signed & approved by
g Gazipur PBS/BREB.
05) No accommodation for the Construction labour and other employee will be provided.
08) Any Sabotage/subversive activities by your construction fabour will be fiable to legal action as per the Law of
the land.
07) if any iocal problems / obstacie / Right of way hazard arises shall be done / solved by you at your own
arrangement and cost.
We hope all the terms & condition as mentioned above are acceptabie to you. Piease acknowledge receipt of
this work order as a token of your acceptance. -

Thanking you
Fo( 3 - gy
Md. Anamul Hoque Major Syéd Sakhawat Hussain (Retd) Syed Rezaul Hossain Kazi
Chief Engineer Director Managing Director

. HEAD OFFICE : E-13, "Lutfun Tower" Middle Badda, Gulshan-1, Dhaka-1212. TEL : +88-02-9897356
E-mail : info@aptechdesignsitd.com, Web: www.aptechdesignsitd.com
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ShiEan Barua - —

From: shamim Mir <mirshamim@cross-world.com>

Sent: Sunday, October 21, 2018 11:16 AM

To: : Shipan Barua

Cc: Md. Habibur Rahman Jabed; Md. Al Miraj; Tanmoy Sarkar

Subject: Fwd: Regarding extra amount for Ref# AIP/Big Boss/2018 33kV Line construction

additional part 4
Clhert ' APtedn Prduptmial Panwg

Dear Shipai, $.p St vvn AT

Please arrange the additional amount of 33Kv line construction work mb Cheﬁl
Please add 2lac which will be total value 13lac’

NeWly Added 200 000 I Cb—w'\'\mw\ M‘L-ﬂ/L)

Avmount 1‘5
Set Qutlook for Android e - i tjwqf‘@/ 0 002 f/
Yz W 66)
g?nTSSuan%bal;égggger 21, 10:53 AM @ DT

21§
Subject: Fwd: Regarding extra amounéef# AIP/Bigloss/2018 33kV Line construction addm
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Please attach this below mail that | sent to aptech management V""bq M //

Regards, DM W %
Sabbir Ahmed A\~*”"\\
AGM \ae
Project Sales - Y- %
—cross World Power Ltd. (E ﬁk
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Shamim Mir

From: Sabblr Ahmed <sabbir@cross-world.com>

Date: 10/18/18 08:17 (GMT+06:00)

To: major388@gmail.com

Cc: aip.eng@aptechdesignsitd.com, aip. engS@aptechdesignsltd com Harunor Rashid <harunor@cross-
worid.com>, Moshiur Rahman <moshiur@cross-world.com>, Maruf Ahmed <maruf@cross-world.com>,
reza@aptechdesignsltd.com

Subject: Regarding extra amount for Ref# AlP/Big Boss/2018 33kV Line construction additional part

Dear Sir

It was nice meeting with you yesterday 17th October, 2018 at yéur good office. As per yesterday's meeting
with you,

| wanted to urge you to consider a small favour for us regarding our last received work order for 33kV line
construction additional part, Ref: AIP/BIG Boss/2018, dated 09th October 2018.

You aave us the work value 1 100 000.00 (Eleve

LW o=



ur information, within this stipulated financial figure, the mentioned job can't be completed. Because
work will be needed extra manpower, extra materials (8 extra supports to iinstall outdoor CT, PT aand
OF) and total REB drawing should have to be re-approved from authorized personnel.

We are starting our work though but the cost of the work will be 1,475,000.00 BDT (Fourteen Lacs Seventy

fhan Thhosiaomal DINTY il nail osine ot of sl no oreed
Five Thousand BOT) without any soit-of P margii.

So, We, therefore hope and request you to approve additional 375,000.00 BDT with this workorder, so that
we could finish the complete work within our time frame smoothly.

Your kind and prompt action is highly solicited.

Regards,

Sabbir Ahmed
AGM
Project Sales
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