Fahim Muntasir

From: najmul@cross-world.com

Sent: Monday, August 06, 2018 2:10 PM
To: fahim@cross-world.com

Ce: sultan@cross-world.com

Subject: FW: Approval for additional work
fyi...

Cordial Regards,

MD. NAJMUL ISLAM (PRINCE) | CROSS WORLD POWER LIMITED | Engineer-, Project Devision| Plot 1/B, Road 90,
Gulshan 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160| m: +8801755 694136 |
e: najmul@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com

4 Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Engr. Najmul Islam Prince [mailto:najmul.prince@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, August 06, 2018 1:08 PM

To: Md. Najmul Islam

Subject: Fwd: Approval for additional work

Thanks & Regards,

Engr. Md. Najmul Islam (Prince)
Mob: +88 01918 095924; 01755 694136
Email: najmul@cross-world.com

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Mohammad Shoeaib <m.shoaib@nassagroup.org>

Date: Mon, Aug 6, 2018 at 11:38 AM

Subject: RE: Approval for additional work

To: "Engr. Najmul Islam Prince" <najmul.prince@gmail .com>

Cc: "Md. Najmul Islam" <najmul@cross-world.com>, Jasim <jasim@nassagroup.org>

Dear Najmul,
Please continue with the work.

Cordial Regards
Engr. Mohammad Shoaib

Manager, Electrical & Electronics



Nassa Group

238, Tejgaon Industrial Area
Gulshan Link Road
Dhaka-1208

Bangladesh

Telephone: (+88) 028819126, (+88) 028878543-49, (+88) 029830348-54 (Ext. 265)

Mobile:  (+88) 01777064529

Email: m.shoaib@nassagroup.org

Web: www.nassagroup.org

Please consider the environment before printing this email

This communication contains information from Nassa Group that may be confidential. Except for personal use by the
intended recipient, or as expressly authorized by the sender, any person who receives this information is prohibited
from disclosing, copying, distributing, and/or using it. If you have received this communication in error, please
immediately delete it and all copies, and promptly notify the sender. Nothing in this communication is intended to
oOperate as an electronic signature under applicable law.

NASSA GROUP CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY INFORMATION

The contents of this material are confidential and proprietary to Nassa Group and may not be reproduced, disclosed,
distributed or used without the express permission of an authorized'representative of Nassa Group. Any other use is

expressly prohibited

From: Engr. Najmul Islam Prince [mailto:najmul.prince @gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, August 6, 2018 11:17 AM
To: Engr. Mohammad Shoaib




Cc: Md. Najmul Islam
Subject: Approval for additional work

Dear Shoaib Vi

Re installation charge will need 60,000.00TK
Additional local materials Cost 55,000.00TK.

Total additional cost 1,15,000.00TK

Please provide us approval for additional work.

Note that,
Will be re installation of BBT.

1. Floor 3%, 4t 5% ( Swing)
2. 2" Floor Cutting.

Thanks & Regards,

Engr. Md. Najmul Islam (Prince)
Mob: +88 01918 095924; 01755 694136
Email: najmul@cross-world.com



