Md. Moazzem Hossain

From: Rahat Fahim Manwar <manwar@cross-world.com>

Sent: May 14, 2018 4:10 PM

ilio: moazzem@cross-world.com

Cc: aziz@cross-world.com; moshiur@cross-world.com; zia@cross-world.com; sultan@cross-
world.com; habib@cross-world.com

Subject: FW: ST ROOM LAYOUT.

Importance: High %%Wﬁm

Dear Moazzem Vai,

Below is the mail approval of cable tray from client. Please raise a requisition immediately.

Rahat Fahim Manwar | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Sr. Engineer , Engineering Dept. | House # 1/B, Road #
90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | m:
01755514874 | e: manwar@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com

From: mohammad alamin [mailto:m.alamin283 @gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, May 14, 2018 3:53 PM

To: Rahat Fahim Manwar

Subject: Re: STROOM LAYOUT.

Please process from your end.

On Mon, 14 May 2018, 14:13 Rahat Fahim Manwar, <manwar(@cross-world.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

.

Refer to today’s telephonic discussion with Mr. Kawsar Sir, we were instructed to install cable tray inside cable
drain. As no price quotation was provided to you earlier, below is the spec & price of the said item:

Item Description Unit Qty | Unit Price Total Price Remarks
Cable Tray | WxH- 250mmx 37mm made with Meter | 11 1,428/= |/ 15,708/=
37x37x4mm MS angle, Flat Bar (Appx) //

37x4mm, welding & corrosion
resistive paint
In Word: Taka Fifteen Thousand Seven Hundred & Eight Only.

We would request for mail confirmation as a token of acceptance and to enable us to proceed for fabricatioﬁ\}fy

supply & installation at earliest. & %\m
For further query/assistance, please contact me without any hesitation. W b\D@

Rahat Fahim Manwar | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Sr. Engineer , Engineering Dept. | House # 1/B, Road
90, Gulshan - 2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh | p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 | m:
01755514874 | e: manwar@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com
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