Al-Miraj

From: Habibur Rahman <habib@cross-world.com>

Sent: Monday, March 20, 2017 12:21 PM

To: Moazzem@cross-world.com; 'Al-Miraj'

Cc: manwar@cross-world.com; mahmudur@cross-world.com

Subject: FW: DG Installation Materials Pricing

Attachments: Emdad Sir (RUET)_BOQ_30KVA_Kamal (27-02-2017)_R03 (For Power Cable only)-2nd
WO .xlsx

@Moju- Need requisition soon.

@Miraj- need software entry.

Sincerely,

Md. Habibur Rahman | CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Manager, Customer Relations| House NE(O) 06, Road 92, Gulshan-
2 Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| Cell: +88 (02) 01755514711, p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 5160 |e:
habib@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com P please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Rahat Fahim manwar [mailto:manwar@cross-world.com]

Sent: Monday, March 20, 2017 10:00 AM

To: habib@cross-world.com

Cc: sultan@cross-world.com; moazzem@cross-world.com; rubayet@cross-world.com; mizan@cross-world.com;
rokib@cross-world.com; rafi@cross-world.com; k.hossain@cross-world.com

Subject: FW: DG Installation Materials Pricing

Dear Habib Vai,
Below is the approval for power cable supply from CWPL. Requesting to take action urgently.
Best Regards,

Rahat Fahim Manwar |CROSS WORLD POWER LTD.| Engineer , Engineering Department | House NE(O)06 , Road 92,
Gulshan-2 , Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p:
+880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | mob: 01755514874 | f: +880 2 5881 5160

From: Dr Md Rabiul Islam [mailto:rabiulbd@hotmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, March 19, 2017 6:16 PM

To: Rahat Fahim manwar

Subject: RE: DG Installation Materials Pricing

Dear Mr. Fahim,

It should be OK. Please process as required.
Regards,

Rabiul



From: Rahat Fahim manwar [manwar@cross-world.com]

Sent: Sunday, March 19, 2017 3:46 PM

To: 'Dr Md Rabiul Islam’

Cc: k.hossain@cross-world.com; sultan@cross-world.com; habib@cross-world.com; moazzem@cross-world.com
Subject: RE: DG Installation Materials Pricing

Dear Sir,

Need the below cable work order confirmation via your mail:

1.1
Power Cable (35 °C Ambient on air )
4C- 16 rm NYY DG To ATS

Meter

1.2
4C- 16 rm NYY MAINS To ATS

Meter

1.3
4C- 16 NYY ATS To LOAD

Meter

Best Regards,

Rahat Fahim Manwar |CROSS WORLD POWER LTD.| Engineer , Engineering Department | House NE(O)06 , Road 92,
Gulshan-2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p:
+880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | mob: 01755514874 | f: +880 2 5881 5160



From: Dr Md Rabiul Islam [mailto:rabiulbd@hotmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, March 01, 2017 5:29 PM

To: Rahat Fahim manwar; Dr Md Rabiul Islam

Cc: k.hossain@cross-world.com; sultan@cross-world.com; habib@cross-world.com
Subject: RE: DG Installation Materials Pricing

Dear Mr Manwar,
It looks good. You may confirm the order accordingly.
Regards,

Dr Rabiul

From: Rahat Fahim manwar [manwar@cross-world.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2017 4:39 PM

To: rabiulbd@hotmail.com<mailto:rabiulbd@hotmail.com>

Cc: k.hossain@cross-world.com<mailto:k.hossain@cross-world.com>;
sultan@cross-world.com<mailto:sultan@cross-world.com>;
habib@cross-world.com<mailto:habib@cross-world.com>

Subject: DG Installation Materials Pricing

Dear Sir,

Please have the final pricing for 30 KVA DG installation materials. For any query, please contact with me.

Best Regards,

Rahat Fahim Manwar |CROSS WORLD POWER LTD.| Engineer , Engineering Department | House NE(O)06 , Road 92,
Gulshan-2, Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p:
+880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | mob: 01755514874 | f: +880 2 5881 5160






