~ Ref. No: PG/HO/Admin/06/17/18
~ Date: 15/01/2017

To

Cross World Power Lid.
H: NE (0) 06, R: 92,
Gulshan-2, Dhaka-1212.

~ e-mail: info@cross-world.com

* Kind Attention: Zahidur Rahman, (Engineer, Sales & Marketing).

~ Subject: Work order for Supplying of Electric installation works for ZNos 250 KVA Diesel Generator,

—

. Dear Sir,
5 ~ The quotation as you have submitted on the captioned subject for the following spare parts as quoted their on.
: [ SL ’ Total
REQUIRED ITEM/ GOODS QT | UNIT :
i DESCRIPTION |  recpnicAL DETAILS/BRAND | VoM | v | saLe | P
1 | Generator Earthing:
o= 1334
11 Earthting Block / Dimension LXWXD - 200mm X 45mm Set > | 867
" | Equipotential bar X 5mm with connection facility
: 1 X 35 rm BYA (Green) from Earthing 1320
1.2 | Earthing Cable Copper bar to gen & equipment Meter | 40 | 33 gl
: 35rm Material -Copper , Surface- 324
1.3 | Earthing Cable lugs Electro Tinned Pes 12 |y
2 | Exhaust System: 'l
2.1 | Exhaust Flange Welding neck flange 127mm bore Pcs 8 1,000 | 8000
Insulation with Rockwool/ Glasswool | 24000
g3l =R (37mm) and 26 SWG aluminium Job | 2 | 12000
sheet clading
- With MS angle 37X37X5 mm, flat bar, 31200
2.3 | Exhaust Fitting | nut bolt, Royal Bolt etc. Job 2 15,600
Total Price= ¥ oL I
|
Discount= 0
'y d
55000 |

| After Discount= | e

Terms & conditions:
I. Necessary job is to be done within 7 working days from the date of issuance the work order.
2. You need to handover the propose plant with due completion to our related person/ officer who will certify the '
job done by you.
Other terms & Conditions:
a. Delay in completion of the job would not be accepted.
b. 100% payment would be made after completion of the work.

-
b Ullah)

AGM (Admin & HR & Company Secretary)

For kind information: Distribution:

| . Chairman. 1. CFO, Head Office.

2. Director & CEQ. 2. 5r. AGM (Factory), PFL

3. Director Operation. 3. AGM (Fish & Culture), PFHL.

4. Manager (Admin), PFHL.

Head Office : House # 270, Read # 03, New DOHS, Baridhara, Dhaka-1206. Bangladesh. Phone : 02-8411534
Corporalg Office : Proggesswe Tower (1st floor), 1837, Sk. Mujib Road, Badamtoll, Agrabad C/A, Chittagong. Phone : 031.2524563, 2525465
e-mail : provitagroupinfo@yahoo.com, website: www. provilagroupbd.com




P

Habibur Rahman Javed

From: Zahidur Rahman <zahidur@cross-world.com>
Sent: Monday, January 16, 2017 11:24 AM

To: 'Habibur Rahman Javed'

Ce ‘Iftekhar Karim'; miraj@cross-world.com
Subject: Work order for Electrical Works
Attachments: 2017-01-15-15-48-56-01.jpg

Dear Habib,

Please find the attached file and take necessary action to smoothly completion the work .

As per our discussion with COO sir we are added earthling boring work with this work order free of cost.

Best regards,

Muhammad Zahidur Rahman Chakder| CROSS WORLD POWER LTD | Engineer, Sales| House NE(O) 06,
Road 92, Gulshan-2 Dhaka 1212, Bangladesh| p: +880 2 5881 1858, 989 1442 | f: +880 2 5881 6205 | Mobile: 01755
514 782 | e: zahidur@cross-world.com | w: www.cross-world.com

ﬁ please consider the environment before printing this B

From: Igbal Hossain [mailto:igbal.provita@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, January 15, 2017 3:51 PM

To: zahidur@cross-world.com

Subject: Work order for Electrical Works

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Komol Hossain <komol84(@gmail.com>
Date: Sun, Jan 15, 2017 at 3:49 PM

Subject:

To: Igbal Hossain <igbal.provita@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,
Please check the attached document

Sincerely,



