Al-Miraj

Subject: FW: Generator ducting requirement

From: Md. Moshiur Rahman [mailto:moshiur@cross-world.com]
Sent: Sunday, July 31, 2016 7:19 PM

To: 'Mahabub'

Cc: habib@cross-world.com; 'Md. Azizur Rahman'

Subject: FW: Generator ducting requirement

Dear Mahabub,

Please send the vendor tomorrow (01/08/16) for doing the following job.

Best Regards,

Md. Moshiur Rahman | CROSS WORLD POWER LIMITED | AGM, Sales |
I I

| : WWW.cross-world.com

From: Md. Moshiur Rahman [mailto:moshiur@cross-world.com]

Sent: Sunday, July 31, 2016 6:27 PM

To: 'SHAHIN MD. M. KHAN'; 'S. Noor'; 'Lutfor Rahman'; 'Zafar Sadique'; 'Janith Lasantha'
Cc: habib@cross-world.com; 'Mahabub'

Subject: RE: Generator ducting requirement

Dear sir,

Please be informed that the ducting cost for the 350KVA generator will be 24,000/- only.
Need to have your confirmation to do the job ASAP.

Please feel free to contact us if you have any further query.

Best Regards,

Md. Moshiur Rahman | CROSS WORLD POWER LIMITED | AGM, Sales |
I I

| : www.cross-world.com

From: SHAHIN MD. M. KHAN [mailto:adojeans@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, July 31, 2016 5:07 PM




To: Moshiur Rahman; S. Noor; Lutfor Rahman; Zafar Sadique; Janith Lasantha
Subject: Fwd: Generator ducting requirement

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: "aminul islam" <aminul93.te@gmail.com>

Date: 31 Jul 2016 17:05

Subject: Generator ducting requirement

To: "SHAHIN MD. M. KHAN" <adojeans@gmail.com>
Cc:

Dear Sir,

Please take a look at the following attached file. The red marked highlighted items are required for generator
ducting.

Best regards,

Md. Aminul Islam

Executive Officer

Contact No. 01717138504

Target Denim & Casual Wear Limited



